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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

1 Dense Graded Aggregate, 6" Thick 126 SY $25.00 $3,150.00 $35.00 $4,410.00 $70.00 $8,820.00 $36.00 $4,536.00

2 12’ Wide Vehicle Access Cattle Gate 1 Lump Sum $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,350.00 $3,350.00 $2,940.00 $2,940.00

3 Wood Guide Rail 84 LF $38.00 $3,192.00 $112.00 $9,408.00 $94.00 $7,896.00 $90.00 $7,560.00

4 6’ High Chain Link Field Fencing 211 LF $40.00 $8,440.00 $50.00 $10,550.00 $85.00 $17,935.00 $100.00 $21,100.00

5 4' High Chain Link Field Fencing With Safety Top 478 LF $37.00 $17,686.00 $44.00 $21,032.00 $38.00 $18,164.00 $33.00 $15,774.00

6   10’ Wide 6’ High Chain Link Field  Access Gate 1 Unit $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,260.00 $1,260.00

7 Foul Poles (1 Set – 2 Units) 1 Lump Sum $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,150.00 $3,150.00

8 Infield Mix, 4” Thick 255 SY $32.00 $8,160.00 $30.00 $7,650.00 $50.00 $12,750.00 $100.00 $25,500.00

9 4” Thick Concrete Pad 160 SY $97.00 $15,520.00 $85.00 $13,600.00 $85.00 $13,600.00 $50.00 $8,000.00

10 Bleachers 2 Unit $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00

11 12' High Chain Link Batting Cage and Bullpen Fencing 1 Lump Sum $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $32,650.00 $32,650.00

12 Remove Existing Batting Cage 1 Lump Sum $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

13 Backstop 1 Lump Sum $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $25,900.00 $25,900.00

14  Bollards 3 Units $250.00 $750.00 $300.00 $900.00 $300.00 $900.00 $200.00 $600.00

15 6' High Fence Post 1 Unit $250.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,625.00 $2,625.00

16 General Fence Repairs (Babe Ruth) 1 Lump Sum
$3,000.00

$3,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
$5,500.00

$5,500.00
$250.00

$250.00

17 Remove Concrete Pad & Cap Existing Water Line 1 Lump Sum
$2,500.00

$2,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
$3,500.00

$3,500.00
$10,000.00

$10,000.00

18 Concrete Bumper Blocks, Pinned 7 Units $150.00 $1,050.00 $150.00 $1,050.00 $125.00 $875.00 $800.00 $5,600.00

***indicates mathematical correction of price bid

$188,445.00

DELANCO TOWNSHIP

Engineer's Estimate THOR Construction Group LLC Sussman

West Long Branch, NJ 07764 Brigantine, NJ 08203

BASE BID 

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID $141,600.00 $167,990.00$119,248.00

125 Kings HighwayP O Box 771P O Box 518

Mt. Royal, NJ 08061

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 1-30-20 10:00 AM

WEST AVENUE & BABE RUTH BALL FIELDS IMPROVEMENT PROJECT

Think Pavers
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

1 Dense Graded Aggregate, 6" Thick 126 SY

2 12’ Wide Vehicle Access Cattle Gate 1 Lump Sum

3 Wood Guide Rail 84 LF

4 6’ High Chain Link Field Fencing 211 LF

5 4' High Chain Link Field Fencing With Safety Top 478 LF

6   10’ Wide 6’ High Chain Link Field  Access Gate 1 Unit

7 Foul Poles (1 Set – 2 Units) 1 Lump Sum

8 Infield Mix, 4” Thick 255 SY

9 4” Thick Concrete Pad 160 SY

10 Bleachers 2 Unit

11 12' High Chain Link Batting Cage and Bullpen Fencing 1 Lump Sum

12 Remove Existing Batting Cage 1 Lump Sum

13 Backstop 1 Lump Sum

14  Bollards 3 Units

15 6' High Fence Post 1 Unit

16 General Fence Repairs (Babe Ruth) 1 Lump Sum

17 Remove Concrete Pad & Cap Existing Water Line 1 Lump Sum

18 Concrete Bumper Blocks, Pinned 7 Units

BASE BID 

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 1-30-20 10:00 AM

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

$69.00 $8,694.00 $71.28 $8,981.28

$1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,890.00 $2,890.00

$100.00 $8,400.00 $65.52 $5,503.68

$60.00 $12,660.00 $77.54 $16,360.94

$50.00 $23,900.00 $72.10 $34,463.80

$1,500.00 $1,500.00 $3,540.00 $3,540.00

$4,290.00 $4,290.00 $4,995.00 $4,995.00

$125.00 $31,875.00 $64.74 $16,508.70

$63.00 $10,080.00 $109.12 $17,459.20

$6,762.00 $13,524.00 $7,032.50 $14,065.00

$27,500.00 $27,500.00 $72,847.00 $72,847.00

$5,000.00 $5,000.00 $19,400.00 $19,400.00

$31,500.00 $31,500.00 $68,559.60 $68,559.60

$500.00 $1,500.00 $766.30 $2,298.90

$3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,261.00 $1,261.00

$10,000.00
$10,000.00

$5,670.00
$5,670.00

$2,500.00
$2,500.00

$8,196.50
$8,196.50

$100.00 $700.00 $1,060.00 $7,420.00

NO BID$310,420.60$198,123.00 NO BID

Allentown, NJ 08501 Hawthorne, NY 10532 Amityville. NY 11701 Burlington, NJ 08016

Harris Fence

11 Bradhurst Avenue 235 County Line Road 1106A Jacksonville Rd.

WEST AVENUE & BABE RUTH BALL FIELDS IMPROVEMENT PROJECT

DELANCO TOWNSHIP

Viviano Construction LLC Giacorp Contracting Inc. Land Tek

46 Reidgeview way
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

1 Dense Graded Aggregate, 6" Thick 126 SY

2 12’ Wide Vehicle Access Cattle Gate 1 Lump Sum

3 Wood Guide Rail 84 LF

4 6’ High Chain Link Field Fencing 211 LF

5 4' High Chain Link Field Fencing With Safety Top 478 LF

6   10’ Wide 6’ High Chain Link Field  Access Gate 1 Unit

7 Foul Poles (1 Set – 2 Units) 1 Lump Sum

8 Infield Mix, 4” Thick 255 SY

9 4” Thick Concrete Pad 160 SY

10 Bleachers 2 Unit

11 12' High Chain Link Batting Cage and Bullpen Fencing 1 Lump Sum

12 Remove Existing Batting Cage 1 Lump Sum

13 Backstop 1 Lump Sum

14  Bollards 3 Units

15 6' High Fence Post 1 Unit

16 General Fence Repairs (Babe Ruth) 1 Lump Sum

17 Remove Concrete Pad & Cap Existing Water Line 1 Lump Sum

18 Concrete Bumper Blocks, Pinned 7 Units

BASE BID 

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 1-30-20 10:00 AM

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

WEST AVENUE & BABE RUTH BALL FIELDS IMPROVEMENT PROJECT

DELANCO TOWNSHIP

NO BID

Construct Connect

30 Technology Pkwy.

Norcross, GA 30092

NO BID

Command Co. Inc.

1318 Antwerp Avenue

Egg Harbor City, NJ 08215
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