
NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

1 5' High Aluminum Puppy Fence 190 LF $91.00 $17,290.00 $87.00 $16,530.00

2 4' Thick Concrete Slab 250 SF $21.00 $5,250.00 $17.00 $4,250.00

3 Construct Landscape Swale & Berm 1 LS $1,950.00 $1,950.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

4 Install 4' Wide Puppy Gate 3 UNIT $390.00 $1,170.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00

5 Install 8' Wide Puppy Gate 1 UNIT $1,040.00 $1,040.00 $1,700.00 $1,700.00

1A1 5' High Aluminum Standard Fence 234 LF $65.00 $15,210.00 $70.00 $16,380.00

2A1 Install 8' Wide Standard Gate 1 UNIT $1,040.00 $1,040.00 $1,700.00 $1,700.00

1A2 5' High Aluminum Puppy Fence 234 LF $91.00 $21,294.00 $87.00 $20,358.00

2A2 Install 8' Wide Puppy Gate 1 UNIT $1,040.00 $1,040.00 $1,700.00 $1,700.00

2152 Whites Ville Rd.
Toms River, NJ 08755

P:(732) 984-7464
F:(732) 984-7454

Alternate Bid No. 2

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID NO. 2 $22,334.00 $22,058.00 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID NO. 1 $16,250.00 $18,080.00 NO BID NO BID

Alternate Bid No. 1

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID $26,700.00 $31,480.00 NO BID NO BID

Base Bid 

F:(732) 963-9758 F:(609) 654-6537 F:(215) 447-3145
P:(973) 222-2162 P:(609) 654-6060 P:(215) 447-3140

West Long Branch, NJ 07764 Medford, NJ 08055 Bensalem, PA 19020
PO Box 518 167B, Route 70 735 Birch Ave

ABHZEEN DESIGN INC. THOR CONSTRUCTION GROUP ALENCO FENCE & PAVER CORP. BUSTLETON SERVICES, INC.

BID OPENING: 06/11/20 AT 11:00 AM BOROUGH OF RIVERTON
38005 00

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS

BID OPENING

RIVERTON DOG PARK CONSTRUCTION
BLOCK 99, LOT 6


