

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 11/24/20 10:30 AM				SEWER TREATMENT PLANT AND PUMP STATION DEBRIS REMOVAL CONTRACT 2021 BOROUGH OF PALMYRA BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 44000 25											
				<i>Engineer's Estimate</i>		Franc Environmental Inc.		Environmental Protection & Improvement Company, LLC		United Site Services		Montana Construction, Inc.			
						960 Jackson Road Ivlyland, PA 18974 P (215) 443-0650		435 Williams Court, Suite 100 Baltimore, MD 21220 P (410) 688-4438 F (443) 489-9042		3168 Bordertown Avenue Old Bridge, NJ 08857 P 1-(800) 628-8955		80 Contant Avenue Lodi, NJ 07644 P (973) 478-5200 F (973) 478-7604			
= mathematically corrected value based on governing unit prices															
NO	DESCRIPTION	Qty	UNIT			UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT		
CONTRACT YEAR 2021															
1	EQ Tank, Grit Chamber (20 CY debris disposal per cleaning)	4	EA	\$4,500.00	\$18,000.00	\$4,826.00	\$19,304.00	NO BID RECEIVED		NO BID RECEIVED		NO BID RECEIVED			
2	EQ Tank (20 CY debris disposal per cleaning)	4	EA	\$5,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$4,572.00	\$18,288.00								
3	Package Plant, Aeration and Settling Chamber (40 CY debris disposal per cleaning)	1	LS	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,795.00	\$10,795.00								
4	Package Plant, Digester (15 CY debris disposal per cleaning)	1	LS	\$4,500.00	\$4,500.00	\$4,572.00	\$4,572.00								
5	Korman Pump Station (3 CY debris disposal per cleaning)	3	LS	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	\$628.65	\$1,885.95								
6	Jersey Pump Station (3 CY debris disposal per cleaning)	2	LS	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	\$628.65	\$1,257.30								
7	River Front Pump Station (3 CY debris disposal per cleaning)	2	LS	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	\$628.65	\$1,257.30								
8	Berkley Pump Station (3 CY debris disposal per cleaning)	3	LS	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	\$628.65	\$1,885.95								
9	Public Road Pump Station (3 CY debris disposal per cleaning)	2	LS	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	\$628.65	\$1,257.30								
Line Cleaning															
10	Backup Jetting & Vactoring Services (Emergency Work 1 Day = 4 Hours)	4	Days	\$1,750.00	\$7,000.00	\$1,500.00	\$6,000.00								
TOTAL BID PRICE (2021)				\$68,500.00		\$66,502.80		NO BID RECEIVED		NO BID RECEIVED		NO BID RECEIVED			