

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS, INC. SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 07/08/2021 at 11:00 AM				HANOVER COURT DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENT PROJECT NORTH HANOVER TOWNSHIP BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 23556 01							
				Vulcan Construction, Inc.		Capela Construction, Inc.		RME Inc, & Sons		Compass Construction, Inc.	
				3 Hance Drive Cookstown, NJ 08511 P: 848-525-1201 F: 609-758-7863		20 Tranquility Court Southampton, NJ 08088 P: 609-535-5367 F: 609-801-2533		3 Meirs Road Cream Ridge, NJ 08514 P: 609-758-7809 F: 609-758-4930		31 North Main St New Egypt, NJ 08533 P: 609-286-2235 F: 609-286-2255	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
1	Construct Drainage Improvements, Complete	1	L.S.	\$18,200.00	\$18,200.00	\$22,350.00	\$22,350.00	\$24,900.00	\$24,900.00	\$26,000.00	\$26,000.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID				\$18,200.00		\$22,350.00		\$24,900.00		\$26,000.00	

				Crest Construction, Inc.		Earle Asphalt Company		Seacoast Construction Inc.		Coastline Construction LLC	
				880 Route 9 Little Egg Harbor Twp., NJ, 08087 P: 609-698-2122		PO Box 556 Farmingdale, NJ 07727 P: 732-308-1113 x206 F: 732-308-1034		15 Addington Court East Brunswick, NJ 08816 P: 732-238-6963 F: 732-238-6083		1959 Route 206 Southampton, NJ 08088 P: 609-351-1542 F: 609-801-2777	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
1	Construct Drainage Improvements, Complete	1	L.S.	\$27,075.00	\$27,075.00	\$31,313.13	\$31,313.13	\$87,125.00	\$87,125.00		NO BID
TOTAL AMOUNT BID				\$27,075.00		\$31,313.13		\$87,125.00		NO BID	

				CMS Construction, Inc.	
				521 North Avenue Plainfield, NJ 07060 P: 862-755-0466 F: 973-718-4005	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
1	Construct Drainage Improvements, Complete	1	L.S.		NO BID
TOTAL AMOUNT BID				NO BID	