

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS BID SUMMARY BID OPENING: 3/31/22 AT 11:00 AM				DEMOLITION OF 200 ASH STREET TOWNSHIP OF DELANCO BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 39050 06								DEMOLITION OF 200 ASH STREET TOWNSHIP OF DELANCO BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 39050 06							
				FR Beinke Wrecking Inc.		Neuber Environmental Services, Inc.		Terra Technical Services, LLC.		R.E. Pierson Construction Co.		Caravella Demolition		Winzinger Inc.		Two Brothers Contracting		Neri Construction & Rental, Inc.	
				PO Box 444 Swedesboro, NJ 08085 P: (856) 269-7626		1100 Grosser Roads Suite C Gilbertsville, PA 19525 P: (610) 933-4332 x 102 F: (610) 933-1124		600 Brandywine Avenue Suite 100 Dowington, PA 19335 P: (610) 806-3095 F: (610) 269-6355		426 Swedesboro Road PO Box 430 Pliesgrove, NJ 08098 P: (856) 769-8244 F: (856) 769-5630		40 Defrost Avenue East Hanover, NJ 07936 P: (973) 884-4900 F: (973) 240-7412		1704 Marine Highway Hainesport, NJ 08036 P: (609) 267-8600 F: (609) 267-5195		11 Vreeland Avenue Totowa, NJ 07512 P: (973) 689-8191 F: (973) 956-8811		849 Clayton Road Williamstown, NJ 08094 P: (856) 629-2408	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID																			
1	Demolish Building, Complete	1	LS	\$193,000.00	\$193,000.00	\$230,000.00	\$230,000.00	\$244,400.00	\$244,400.00	\$263,300.00	\$263,300.00	\$280,905.50	\$280,905.50	\$366,050.00	\$366,050.00	\$358,550.00	\$358,550.00	\$492,106.00	\$492,106.00
2	Install 6" High Chain Link Fence	120	LF	\$30.00	\$3,600.00	\$14.21	\$1,705.20	\$29.17	\$3,500.40	\$65.00	\$7,800.00	\$82.50	\$9,900.00	\$57.50	\$6,900.00	\$90.00	\$10,800.00	\$56.00	\$6,720.00
3	Topsoil, Fertilize & Seed	1,500	SY	\$3.72	\$5,580.00	\$11.89	\$17,835.00	\$5.00	\$7,500.00	\$6.50	\$9,750.00	\$0.01	\$15.00	\$6.70	\$10,050.00	\$11.50	\$17,250.00	\$12.00	\$18,000.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID				\$202,180.00		\$249,540.20		\$255,400.40		\$280,850.00		\$290,820.50		\$383,000.00		\$386,600.00		\$516,826.00	

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS BID SUMMARY BID OPENING: 3/31/22 AT 11:00 AM				DEMOLITION OF 200 ASH STREET TOWNSHIP OF DELANCO BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 39050 06								DEMOLITION OF 200 ASH STREET TOWNSHIP OF DELANCO BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 39050 06							
				Plymouth Environmental Co., Inc.		Ricco Demolition		RNM Construction LLC.		The Ambient Group LLC.		The Original W. Hargrove Demolition Co., Inc.		Yannuzzi Group, Inc.					
				923 Haws Avenue Norristown, PA 19401-3737 P: (610) 239-9920 F: (610) 239-9921		282 Creek Road Bellmawr, NJ 08031 P: (856) 931-3366		45 Hockamick Road Cookstown, NJ 08511 P: (609) 768-2919 F: (866) 370-3611		2515 Glassboro Cross Keys Road Williamstown, NJ 08094 P: (856) 582-1765 x 103 F: (856) 582-2114		1507 State Street Camden, NJ 08105 P: (856) 225-1100 F: (856) 541-0841		135 Kinnelon Road Suite 102 Kinnelon, NJ 07405 P: (908) 218-0880 F: (908) 218-0884					
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT		
BASE BID																			
1	Demolish Building, Complete	1	LS																
2	Install 6" High Chain Link Fence	120	LF																
3	Topsoil, Fertilize & Seed	1,500	SY																
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID							