
NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
BASE BID

1A 8" CLDIP Water Main 2,130 LF
1B 8" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 1,070 LF
2 8" Wet Tap and Valve 1 UNIT
3 8" Insertion Valve 1 UNIT
4 8" Gate Valve and Box 7 UNIT
5 8" x 8" CLDIP Tee 2 UNIT
6 4" x 8" CLDIP Reducer 1 UNIT
7 4" Gate Valve and Box 1 UNIT
8 4" (11.25, 22.5, 45 Degree) CLDIP Bends 4 UNIT

9A 4" CLDIP Water Main 6 LF
9B 4" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 6 LF
10 4" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT

11A 8" CLDIP 11.25 Degree Bend 10 UNIT
11B 8" CLDIP 22.5 Degree Bend 8 UNIT
11C 8" CLDIP 45 Degree Bend 36 UNIT
12 1" Curb Stop and Box 49 UNIT
13 1" Corporation Stop 49 UNIT
14 1" Type "K" Copper Water Service 1,500 LF
15 Fire Hydrant, Complete 5 UNIT
16 Trench Repair, Type I 50 LF
17 Trench Repair, Type II 3,245 LF
18 Trench Repair, Type IV 15 LF
19 Concrete Driveway Trench (If and Where Directed) 50 SY
20 Concrete Driveway Apron (If and Where Directed) 55 SY
21 Concrete Sidewalk (If and Where Directed) 40 SY
22 Concrete Curb (If and Where Directed) 30 LF
23 Monument Boxes (If and Where Directed) 5 UNIT
24 Test Pits (If and Where Directed) 5 UNIT
25 Paving Repair (If and Where Directed) 100 SY

26 Connection to Meter in Home (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT

27 8" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT

Mathematically Corrected Value

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

SUMMARY OF BIDS
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

Bid Opening  04/27/22 @ 11:00 AM

 EVERGREEN AND WHITE PINE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
MEDFORD TOWNSHIP

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25110 20

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
` `

$85.00 $181,050.00 $112.50 $239,625.00 $95.00 $202,350.00 $120.25 $256,132.50
$85.00 $90,950.00 $119.00 $127,330.00 $105.00 $112,350.00 $125.25 $134,017.50

$11,000.00 $11,000.00 $8,648.13 $8,648.13 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $9,200.00 $9,200.00
$11,000.00 $11,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $12,700.00 $12,700.00
$5,500.00 $38,500.00 $3,100.00 $21,700.00 $3,500.00 $24,500.00 $3,000.00 $21,000.00

$550.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $2,200.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00 $1,235.00 $2,470.00
$500.00 $500.00 $625.00 $625.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $700.00 $700.00

$4,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $1,830.00 $1,830.00
$400.00 $1,600.00 $450.00 $1,800.00 $400.00 $1,600.00 $400.00 $1,600.00
$60.00 $360.00 $90.00 $540.00 $85.00 $510.00 $225.00 $1,350.00
$60.00 $360.00 $90.00 $540.00 $95.00 $570.00 $230.00 $1,380.00

$400.00 $400.00 $275.00 $275.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00
$400.00 $4,000.00 $650.00 $6,500.00 $700.00 $7,000.00 $400.00 $4,000.00
$400.00 $3,200.00 $650.00 $5,200.00 $700.00 $5,600.00 $400.00 $3,200.00
$400.00 $14,400.00 $650.00 $23,400.00 $700.00 $25,200.00 $400.00 $14,400.00
$400.00 $19,600.00 $240.00 $11,760.00 $1,000.00 $49,000.00 $900.00 $44,100.00
$150.00 $7,350.00 $1,400.00 $68,600.00 $600.00 $29,400.00 $800.00 $39,200.00
$12.00 $18,000.00 $8.00 $12,000.00 $25.00 $37,500.00 $12.00 $18,000.00

$6,000.00 $30,000.00 $9,750.00 $48,750.00 $13,000.00 $65,000.00 $9,000.00 $45,000.00
$30.00 $1,500.00 $10.00 $500.00 $25.00 $1,250.00 $60.00 $3,000.00
$35.00 $113,575.00 $20.00 $64,900.00 $27.00 $87,615.00 $30.00 $97,350.00

$150.00 $2,250.00 $30.00 $450.00 $45.00 $675.00 $1,100.00 $16,500.00
$110.00 $5,500.00 $130.00 $6,500.00 $160.00 $8,000.00 $120.00 $6,000.00
$90.00 $4,950.00 $130.00 $7,150.00 $180.00 $9,900.00 $120.00 $6,600.00

$120.00 $4,800.00 $90.00 $3,600.00 $160.00 $6,400.00 $98.00 $3,920.00
$45.00 $1,350.00 $30.00 $900.00 $55.00 $1,650.00 $40.00 $1,200.00

$1,000.00 $5,000.00 $250.00 $1,250.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $650.00 $3,250.00
$550.00 $2,750.00 $250.00 $1,250.00 $1.00 $5.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00
$40.00 $4,000.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $85.00 $8,500.00 $7.00 $700.00

$4,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $75.00 $150.00

$500.00 $500.00 $650.00 $650.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $950.00 $950.00

$591,545.00

F: (609)-296-2513

$755,400.00$681,893.13 $738,425.00

F: (732)-308-1034 F: (732)-543-2775
P: (732)-543-2777 P: (609)-296-3728P: (732)-308-1113 x 206

Little Egg Harbor Twp., NJ 08087
1510 Route 539, Suite 1.

Farmingdale, NJ 07727 Edison, NJ 08817
PO Box 556 154 Silver Lake Ave.

Commercial Contractors, Inc. Co., Inc.
Engineer's Estimate Mathis ConstructionEarle Co. JVS Industrial &



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

SUMMARY OF BIDS
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

Bid Opening  04/27/22 @ 11:00 AM

ALTERNATE #1
A1A 8" CLDIP Water Main 600 LF
A1B 8" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 200 LF
A2A 8" CLDIP 11.25 Degree Bend 2 UNIT
A2B 8" CLDIP 22.5 Degree Bend 1 UNIT
A2C 8" CLDIP 45 Degree Bend 10 UNIT
A4 Sampling Station 1 UNIT
A5 Trench Repair, Type I 560 LF
A6 Trench Repair, Type II 240 LF

TOTAL ALTERNATE #1 

TOTAL BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1

ALTERNATE #2
B1 6" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 500 LF
B2 6" Wet Tap and Valve 1 UNIT
B3 6" Gate Valve and Box 1 UNIT
B4 6" (11.25, 22.5, 45 Degree) CLDIP Bends 11 UNIT
B5 6" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT
B6 1" Curb Stop and Box 8 UNIT
B7 1" Corporation Stop 8 UNIT
B8 1" Type "K" Copper Water Service 160 LF
B9 2" Blow Off Hydrant 1 UNIT

B10 Trench Repair, Type II 500 LF
B11 Test Pits (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT
B12 Connection to Meter (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT

TOTAL ALTERNATE #2

Mathematically Corrected Value

BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1 & #2 TOTAL 

 EVERGREEN AND WHITE PINE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
MEDFORD TOWNSHIP

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25110 20

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
F: (609)-296-2513F: (732)-308-1034 F: (732)-543-2775

P: (732)-543-2777 P: (609)-296-3728P: (732)-308-1113 x 206

Little Egg Harbor Twp., NJ 08087
1510 Route 539, Suite 1.

Farmingdale, NJ 07727 Edison, NJ 08817
PO Box 556 154 Silver Lake Ave.

Commercial Contractors, Inc. Co., Inc.
Engineer's Estimate Mathis ConstructionEarle Co. JVS Industrial &

$85.00 $51,000.00 $115.00 $69,000.00 $70.00 $42,000.00 $118.50 $71,100.00
$400.00 $80,000.00 $115.00 $23,000.00 $80.00 $16,000.00 $123.50 $24,700.00
$400.00 $800.00 $650.00 $1,300.00 $600.00 $1,200.00 $400.00 $800.00
$400.00 $400.00 $650.00 $650.00 $600.00 $600.00 $400.00 $400.00
$12.00 $120.00 $650.00 $6,500.00 $600.00 $6,000.00 $400.00 $4,000.00

$8,000.00 $8,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,785.00 $5,785.00
$30.00 $16,800.00 $10.00 $5,600.00 $20.00 $11,200.00 $25.00 $14,000.00
$35.00 $8,400.00 $20.00 $4,800.00 $25.00 $6,000.00 $30.00 $7,200.00

$165,520.00

$757,065.00

$80.00 $40,000.00 $90.00 $45,000.00 $47.00 $23,500.00 $117.00 $58,500.00
$9,000.00 $9,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00
$5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,450.00 $2,450.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00

$500.00 $5,500.00 $560.00 $6,160.00 $450.00 $4,950.00 $400.00 $4,400.00
$500.00 $500.00 $560.00 $560.00 $700.00 $700.00 $915.00 $915.00
$400.00 $3,200.00 $240.00 $1,920.00 $650.00 $5,200.00 $900.00 $7,200.00
$150.00 $1,200.00 $1,400.00 $11,200.00 $400.00 $3,200.00 $800.00 $6,400.00
$15.00 $2,400.00 $8.00 $1,280.00 $25.00 $4,000.00 $12.00 $1,920.00

$600.00 $600.00 $4,700.00 $4,700.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00
$35.00 $17,500.00 $20.00 $10,000.00 $20.00 $10,000.00 $30.00 $15,000.00

$550.00 $1,100.00 $250.00 $500.00 $1.00 $2.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00
$4,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $75.00 $150.00

$94,000.00

$851,065.00 $895,077.00 $997,170.00$892,513.13

$96,270.00 $69,652.00

$883,385.00

$113,785.00

$796,243.13

$114,350.00 $87,000.00

$825,425.00

$127,985.00



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
BASE BID

1A 8" CLDIP Water Main 2,130 LF
1B 8" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 1,070 LF
2 8" Wet Tap and Valve 1 UNIT
3 8" Insertion Valve 1 UNIT
4 8" Gate Valve and Box 7 UNIT
5 8" x 8" CLDIP Tee 2 UNIT
6 4" x 8" CLDIP Reducer 1 UNIT
7 4" Gate Valve and Box 1 UNIT
8 4" (11.25, 22.5, 45 Degree) CLDIP Bends 4 UNIT

9A 4" CLDIP Water Main 6 LF
9B 4" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 6 LF
10 4" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT

11A 8" CLDIP 11.25 Degree Bend 10 UNIT
11B 8" CLDIP 22.5 Degree Bend 8 UNIT
11C 8" CLDIP 45 Degree Bend 36 UNIT
12 1" Curb Stop and Box 49 UNIT
13 1" Corporation Stop 49 UNIT
14 1" Type "K" Copper Water Service 1,500 LF
15 Fire Hydrant, Complete 5 UNIT
16 Trench Repair, Type I 50 LF
17 Trench Repair, Type II 3,245 LF
18 Trench Repair, Type IV 15 LF
19 Concrete Driveway Trench (If and Where Directed) 50 SY
20 Concrete Driveway Apron (If and Where Directed) 55 SY
21 Concrete Sidewalk (If and Where Directed) 40 SY
22 Concrete Curb (If and Where Directed) 30 LF
23 Monument Boxes (If and Where Directed) 5 UNIT
24 Test Pits (If and Where Directed) 5 UNIT
25 Paving Repair (If and Where Directed) 100 SY

26 Connection to Meter in Home (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT

27 8" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT

Mathematically Corrected Value

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

SUMMARY OF BIDS
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

Bid Opening  04/27/22 @ 11:00 AM

 EVERGREEN AND WHITE PINE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
MEDFORD TOWNSHIP

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25111 20

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

$105.00 $223,650.00 $100.00 $213,000.00 $122.00 $259,860.00 $118.70 $252,831.00
$113.00 $120,910.00 $110.00 $117,700.00 $128.00 $136,960.00 $220.00 $235,400.00

$9,590.00 $9,590.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $9,200.00 $9,200.00 $11,173.00 $11,173.00
$12,653.00 $12,653.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
$3,097.00 $21,679.00 $3,750.00 $26,250.00 $2,300.00 $16,100.00 $2,680.00 $18,760.00
$1,101.00 $2,202.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $983.00 $1,966.00

$455.00 $455.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $350.00 $350.00 $513.00 $513.00
$1,845.00 $1,845.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $1,695.00 $1,695.00

$625.00 $2,500.00 $750.00 $3,000.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 $326.00 $1,304.00
$80.00 $480.00 $275.00 $1,650.00 $117.00 $702.00 $195.00 $1,170.00

$101.00 $606.00 $300.00 $1,800.00 $130.00 $780.00 $220.00 $1,320.00
$477.00 $477.00 $800.00 $800.00 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $283.00 $283.00
$722.00 $7,220.00 $750.00 $7,500.00 $425.00 $4,250.00 $643.00 $6,430.00
$748.00 $5,984.00 $750.00 $6,000.00 $475.00 $3,800.00 $660.00 $5,280.00
$755.00 $27,180.00 $750.00 $27,000.00 $455.00 $16,380.00 $663.00 $23,868.00
$414.00 $20,286.00 $800.00 $39,200.00 $860.00 $42,140.00 $904.60 $44,325.40
$136.00 $6,664.00 $800.00 $39,200.00 $640.00 $31,360.00 $385.00 $18,865.00
$79.00 $118,500.00 $40.00 $60,000.00 $72.00 $108,000.00 $63.65 $95,475.00

$10,605.00 $53,025.00 $9,000.00 $45,000.00 $12,000.00 $60,000.00 $8,700.00 $43,500.00
$11.00 $550.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 $8.00 $400.00 $17.30 $865.00
$21.00 $68,145.00 $35.00 $113,575.00 $16.00 $51,920.00 $24.50 $79,502.50

$138.00 $2,070.00 $500.00 $7,500.00 $286.00 $4,290.00 $213.00 $3,195.00
$190.00 $9,500.00 $200.00 $10,000.00 $185.00 $9,250.00 $86.40 $4,320.00
$197.00 $10,835.00 $200.00 $11,000.00 $285.00 $15,675.00 $139.55 $7,675.25
$178.00 $7,120.00 $175.00 $7,000.00 $124.00 $4,960.00 $75.00 $3,000.00
$49.00 $1,470.00 $75.00 $2,250.00 $60.00 $1,800.00 $57.60 $1,728.00

$991.00 $4,955.00 $600.00 $3,000.00 $284.00 $1,420.00 $605.00 $3,025.00
$1,863.00 $9,315.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $288.00 $1,440.00

$88.00 $8,800.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $166.00 $16,600.00 $75.00 $7,500.00

$5,577.00 $11,154.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,590.00 $5,180.00

$574.00 $574.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,400.00 $3,400.00 $603.00 $603.00

F: NO FAX LISTED

$835,197.00$770,394.00 $798,175.00 $897,192.15

F: (856)-753-1453 F: (856)-697-9612
P: (856)-769-8244P: (908)-725-1026 P: (856)-768-8943 x 320
F: (856)-769-5630

P: (856)-697-4558
Berlin, NJ 08009 Pilesgrove, NJ 08098North Branch, NJ 08876

PO Box 5297 PO Box 619 PO Box 430
3311 Route 22 427 S White Horse Pike 

Malaga, NJ 08328
426 Swedesboro Road, 

Vollers

PO Box 416
Construction Co., Inc.Co., Inc.

Mount Construction R. E. Pierson FM Schiavone



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

SUMMARY OF BIDS
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

Bid Opening  04/27/22 @ 11:00 AM

ALTERNATE #1
A1A 8" CLDIP Water Main 600 LF
A1B 8" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 200 LF
A2A 8" CLDIP 11.25 Degree Bend 2 UNIT
A2B 8" CLDIP 22.5 Degree Bend 1 UNIT
A2C 8" CLDIP 45 Degree Bend 10 UNIT
A4 Sampling Station 1 UNIT
A5 Trench Repair, Type I 560 LF
A6 Trench Repair, Type II 240 LF

TOTAL ALTERNATE #1 

TOTAL BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1

ALTERNATE #2
B1 6" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 500 LF
B2 6" Wet Tap and Valve 1 UNIT
B3 6" Gate Valve and Box 1 UNIT
B4 6" (11.25, 22.5, 45 Degree) CLDIP Bends 11 UNIT
B5 6" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT
B6 1" Curb Stop and Box 8 UNIT
B7 1" Corporation Stop 8 UNIT
B8 1" Type "K" Copper Water Service 160 LF
B9 2" Blow Off Hydrant 1 UNIT

B10 Trench Repair, Type II 500 LF
B11 Test Pits (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT
B12 Connection to Meter (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT

TOTAL ALTERNATE #2

Mathematically Corrected Value

BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1 & #2 TOTAL 

 EVERGREEN AND WHITE PINE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
MEDFORD TOWNSHIP

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25111 20

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
F: NO FAX LISTED F: (856)-753-1453 F: (856)-697-9612

P: (856)-769-8244P: (908)-725-1026 P: (856)-768-8943 x 320
F: (856)-769-5630

P: (856)-697-4558
Berlin, NJ 08009 Pilesgrove, NJ 08098North Branch, NJ 08876

PO Box 5297 PO Box 619 PO Box 430
3311 Route 22 427 S White Horse Pike 

Malaga, NJ 08328
426 Swedesboro Road, 

Vollers

PO Box 416
Construction Co., Inc.Co., Inc.

Mount Construction R. E. Pierson FM Schiavone

$105.00 $63,000.00 $100.00 $60,000.00 $115.00 $69,000.00 $118.70 $71,220.00
$113.00 $22,600.00 $110.00 $22,000.00 $128.00 $25,600.00 $220.00 $44,000.00
$722.00 $1,444.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $426.00 $852.00 $643.00 $1,286.00
$748.00 $748.00 $750.00 $750.00 $475.00 $475.00 $660.00 $660.00
$755.00 $7,550.00 $750.00 $7,500.00 $455.00 $4,550.00 $663.00 $6,630.00

$4,138.00 $4,138.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00
$11.00 $6,160.00 $30.00 $16,800.00 $8.00 $4,480.00 $17.30 $9,688.00
$21.00 $5,040.00 $55.00 $13,200.00 $19.00 $4,560.00 $24.50 $5,880.00

$112.00 $56,000.00 $105.00 $52,500.00 $138.00 $69,000.00 $85.40 $42,700.00
$8,737.00 $8,737.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,800.00 $7,800.00 $10,110.00 $10,110.00
$2,193.00 $2,193.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,840.00 $1,840.00

$606.00 $6,666.00 $750.00 $8,250.00 $327.00 $3,597.00 $547.00 $6,017.00
$450.00 $450.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $450.00 $450.00
$414.00 $3,312.00 $750.00 $6,000.00 $860.00 $6,880.00 $904.60 $7,236.80
$136.00 $1,088.00 $750.00 $6,000.00 $640.00 $5,120.00 $385.00 $3,080.00
$79.00 $12,640.00 $60.00 $9,600.00 $72.00 $11,520.00 $63.65 $10,184.00

$2,400.00 $2,400.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,695.00 $4,695.00
$21.00 $10,500.00 $50.00 $25,000.00 $19.00 $9,500.00 $24.50 $12,250.00

$1,863.00 $3,726.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $288.00 $576.00
$5,577.00 $11,154.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,590.00 $5,180.00

$1,082,831.00$999,940.00 $1,144,874.95$1,063,775.00

$118,866.00

$927,425.00

$136,350.00 $134,817.00 $104,318.80

$1,040,556.15

$110,680.00 $143,364.00

$948,014.00$881,074.00

$129,250.00 $112,817.00



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
BASE BID

1A 8" CLDIP Water Main 2,130 LF
1B 8" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 1,070 LF
2 8" Wet Tap and Valve 1 UNIT
3 8" Insertion Valve 1 UNIT
4 8" Gate Valve and Box 7 UNIT
5 8" x 8" CLDIP Tee 2 UNIT
6 4" x 8" CLDIP Reducer 1 UNIT
7 4" Gate Valve and Box 1 UNIT
8 4" (11.25, 22.5, 45 Degree) CLDIP Bends 4 UNIT

9A 4" CLDIP Water Main 6 LF
9B 4" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 6 LF
10 4" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT

11A 8" CLDIP 11.25 Degree Bend 10 UNIT
11B 8" CLDIP 22.5 Degree Bend 8 UNIT
11C 8" CLDIP 45 Degree Bend 36 UNIT
12 1" Curb Stop and Box 49 UNIT
13 1" Corporation Stop 49 UNIT
14 1" Type "K" Copper Water Service 1,500 LF
15 Fire Hydrant, Complete 5 UNIT
16 Trench Repair, Type I 50 LF
17 Trench Repair, Type II 3,245 LF
18 Trench Repair, Type IV 15 LF
19 Concrete Driveway Trench (If and Where Directed) 50 SY
20 Concrete Driveway Apron (If and Where Directed) 55 SY
21 Concrete Sidewalk (If and Where Directed) 40 SY
22 Concrete Curb (If and Where Directed) 30 LF
23 Monument Boxes (If and Where Directed) 5 UNIT
24 Test Pits (If and Where Directed) 5 UNIT
25 Paving Repair (If and Where Directed) 100 SY

26 Connection to Meter in Home (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT

27 8" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT

Mathematically Corrected Value

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

SUMMARY OF BIDS
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

Bid Opening  04/27/22 @ 11:00 AM

 EVERGREEN AND WHITE PINE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
MEDFORD TOWNSHIP

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25112 20

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

$155.00 $330,150.00 210.00$                 $447,300.00
$160.00 $171,200.00 215.00$                 $230,050.00

$2,500.00 $2,500.00 9,500.00$              $9,500.00
$3,000.00 $3,000.00 14,835.00$            $14,835.00
$2,500.00 $17,500.00 2,690.00$              $18,830.00

$600.00 $1,200.00 805.00$                 $1,610.00
$300.00 $300.00 380.00$                 $380.00

$1,500.00 $1,500.00 1,490.00$              $1,490.00
$200.00 $800.00 90.00$                   $360.00
$300.00 $1,800.00 1,050.00$              $6,300.00
$300.00 $1,800.00 1,145.00$              $6,870.00
$200.00 $200.00 115.00$                 $115.00

$1.00 $10.00 390.00$                 $3,900.00
$1.00 $8.00 410.00$                 $3,280.00
$1.00 $36.00 1,190.00$              $42,840.00

$1,300.00 $63,700.00 345.00$                 $16,905.00
$1,300.00 $63,700.00 485.00$                 $23,765.00

$10.00 $15,000.00 89.00$                   $133,500.00
$13,800.00 $69,000.00 11,420.00$            $57,100.00

$80.00 $4,000.00 11.50$                   $575.00
$19.00 $61,655.00 13.00$                   $42,185.00

$185.00 $2,775.00 35.00$                   $525.00
$150.00 $7,500.00 165.00$                 $8,250.00
$150.00 $8,250.00 165.00$                 $9,075.00
$90.00 $3,600.00 102.00$                 $4,080.00
$90.00 $2,700.00 48.00$                   $1,440.00

$300.00 $1,500.00 585.00$                 $2,925.00
$1,400.00 $7,000.00 590.00$                 $2,950.00

$1.00 $100.00 63.00$                   $6,300.00

$5,600.00 $11,200.00 2,570.00$              $5,140.00

$400.00 $400.00 480.00$                 $480.00

F: NO FAX LISTED F: (609)-584-2200 F: (973)-478-7604

$854,084.00 $1,102,855.00 NO BID NO BID

F: (609)-270-7468
P: (609)-381-0694 P: (609)-351-1542 P: (973)-478-5200 P: (609)-270-7233

Bridgeton, NJ 08302 Hamilton, NJ 08691 Lodi, NJ 07644
PO Box 68 75 South Gold Drive 80 Contact Avenue

Infrastructure

Hammonton NJ 08037

Waters & Bugbee 

PO Box 793
General Contractors Construction, Inc.

Montana CTX South State, Inc.



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

SUMMARY OF BIDS
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

Bid Opening  04/27/22 @ 11:00 AM

ALTERNATE #1
A1A 8" CLDIP Water Main 600 LF
A1B 8" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 200 LF
A2A 8" CLDIP 11.25 Degree Bend 2 UNIT
A2B 8" CLDIP 22.5 Degree Bend 1 UNIT
A2C 8" CLDIP 45 Degree Bend 10 UNIT
A4 Sampling Station 1 UNIT
A5 Trench Repair, Type I 560 LF
A6 Trench Repair, Type II 240 LF

TOTAL ALTERNATE #1 

TOTAL BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1

ALTERNATE #2
B1 6" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 500 LF
B2 6" Wet Tap and Valve 1 UNIT
B3 6" Gate Valve and Box 1 UNIT
B4 6" (11.25, 22.5, 45 Degree) CLDIP Bends 11 UNIT
B5 6" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT
B6 1" Curb Stop and Box 8 UNIT
B7 1" Corporation Stop 8 UNIT
B8 1" Type "K" Copper Water Service 160 LF
B9 2" Blow Off Hydrant 1 UNIT

B10 Trench Repair, Type II 500 LF
B11 Test Pits (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT
B12 Connection to Meter (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT

TOTAL ALTERNATE #2

Mathematically Corrected Value

BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1 & #2 TOTAL 

 EVERGREEN AND WHITE PINE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
MEDFORD TOWNSHIP

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25112 20

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
F: NO FAX LISTED F: (609)-584-2200 F: (973)-478-7604 F: (609)-270-7468
P: (609)-381-0694 P: (609)-351-1542 P: (973)-478-5200 P: (609)-270-7233

Bridgeton, NJ 08302 Hamilton, NJ 08691 Lodi, NJ 07644
PO Box 68 75 South Gold Drive 80 Contact Avenue

Infrastructure

Hammonton NJ 08037

Waters & Bugbee 

PO Box 793
General Contractors Construction, Inc.

Montana CTX South State, Inc.

$145.00 $87,000.00 100.00$                 $60,000.00
$155.00 $31,000.00 115.00$                 $23,000.00

$1.00 $2.00 620.00$                 $1,240.00
$1.00 $1.00 640.00$                 $640.00
$1.00 $10.00 645.00$                 $6,450.00

$2,000.00 $2,000.00 3,965.00$              $3,965.00
$18.00 $10,080.00 17.75$                   $9,940.00
$40.00 $9,600.00 12.50$                   $3,000.00

$175.00 $87,500.00 95.00$                   $47,500.00
$3,000.00 $3,000.00 7,230.00$              $7,230.00
$1,500.00 $1,500.00 2,280.00$              $2,280.00

$1.00 $11.00 750.00$                 $8,250.00
$300.00 $300.00 175.00$                 $175.00

$1,500.00 $12,000.00 330.00$                 $2,640.00
$1,500.00 $12,000.00 100.00$                 $800.00

$10.00 $1,600.00 95.00$                   $15,200.00
$3,000.00 $3,000.00 4,150.00$              $4,150.00

$45.00 $22,500.00 12.50$                   $6,250.00
$1,500.00 $3,000.00 565.00$                 $1,130.00
$5,600.00 $11,200.00 2,450.00$              $4,900.00

$1,151,388.00 -- --$1,311,595.00

$157,611.00 $100,505.00

-- --

NO BID NO BID

$139,693.00 $108,235.00 NO BID

$993,777.00 $1,211,090.00

NO BID



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
BASE BID

1A 8" CLDIP Water Main 2,130 LF
1B 8" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 1,070 LF
2 8" Wet Tap and Valve 1 UNIT
3 8" Insertion Valve 1 UNIT
4 8" Gate Valve and Box 7 UNIT
5 8" x 8" CLDIP Tee 2 UNIT
6 4" x 8" CLDIP Reducer 1 UNIT
7 4" Gate Valve and Box 1 UNIT
8 4" (11.25, 22.5, 45 Degree) CLDIP Bends 4 UNIT

9A 4" CLDIP Water Main 6 LF
9B 4" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 6 LF
10 4" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT

11A 8" CLDIP 11.25 Degree Bend 10 UNIT
11B 8" CLDIP 22.5 Degree Bend 8 UNIT
11C 8" CLDIP 45 Degree Bend 36 UNIT
12 1" Curb Stop and Box 49 UNIT
13 1" Corporation Stop 49 UNIT
14 1" Type "K" Copper Water Service 1,500 LF
15 Fire Hydrant, Complete 5 UNIT
16 Trench Repair, Type I 50 LF
17 Trench Repair, Type II 3,245 LF
18 Trench Repair, Type IV 15 LF
19 Concrete Driveway Trench (If and Where Directed) 50 SY
20 Concrete Driveway Apron (If and Where Directed) 55 SY
21 Concrete Sidewalk (If and Where Directed) 40 SY
22 Concrete Curb (If and Where Directed) 30 LF
23 Monument Boxes (If and Where Directed) 5 UNIT
24 Test Pits (If and Where Directed) 5 UNIT
25 Paving Repair (If and Where Directed) 100 SY

26 Connection to Meter in Home (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT

27 8" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT

Mathematically Corrected Value

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

SUMMARY OF BIDS
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

Bid Opening  04/27/22 @ 11:00 AM

 EVERGREEN AND WHITE PINE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
MEDFORD TOWNSHIP

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25113 20

    Norcross, GA 30092

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
F: (609)-893-2102

NO BIDNO BID NO BID NO BID

F: (609)-801-2777 F: 1-(866)-570-8187 F: (609)-336-2767
P: (609)-893-8600P:(609)-351-1542 P: 1-(800)-364-2059 P: 1-(844)-326-3826 x 9380

Grand Prairie, TX 75052

85 Ridge Road
Construction LLC

SouthHampton, NJ 08088  South, Suite 100 Suite 160 # 501 Brown Mills, NJ 08015
1959 Route 206 30 Technology Parkway 2860 S State Highway 161,

Coastline Construct Dodge Data Mac-Rose
Connect & Analytics



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

SUMMARY OF BIDS
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

Bid Opening  04/27/22 @ 11:00 AM

ALTERNATE #1
A1A 8" CLDIP Water Main 600 LF
A1B 8" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 200 LF
A2A 8" CLDIP 11.25 Degree Bend 2 UNIT
A2B 8" CLDIP 22.5 Degree Bend 1 UNIT
A2C 8" CLDIP 45 Degree Bend 10 UNIT
A4 Sampling Station 1 UNIT
A5 Trench Repair, Type I 560 LF
A6 Trench Repair, Type II 240 LF

TOTAL ALTERNATE #1 

TOTAL BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1

ALTERNATE #2
B1 6" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 500 LF
B2 6" Wet Tap and Valve 1 UNIT
B3 6" Gate Valve and Box 1 UNIT
B4 6" (11.25, 22.5, 45 Degree) CLDIP Bends 11 UNIT
B5 6" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT
B6 1" Curb Stop and Box 8 UNIT
B7 1" Corporation Stop 8 UNIT
B8 1" Type "K" Copper Water Service 160 LF
B9 2" Blow Off Hydrant 1 UNIT

B10 Trench Repair, Type II 500 LF
B11 Test Pits (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT
B12 Connection to Meter (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT

TOTAL ALTERNATE #2

Mathematically Corrected Value

BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1 & #2 TOTAL 

 EVERGREEN AND WHITE PINE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
MEDFORD TOWNSHIP

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25113 20

    Norcross, GA 30092

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
F: (609)-893-2102F: (609)-801-2777 F: 1-(866)-570-8187 F: (609)-336-2767
P: (609)-893-8600P:(609)-351-1542 P: 1-(800)-364-2059 P: 1-(844)-326-3826 x 9380

Grand Prairie, TX 75052

85 Ridge Road
Construction LLC

SouthHampton, NJ 08088  South, Suite 100 Suite 160 # 501 Brown Mills, NJ 08015
1959 Route 206 30 Technology Parkway 2860 S State Highway 161,

Coastline Construct Dodge Data Mac-Rose
Connect & Analytics

---- -- --

-- -- --

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

--



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
BASE BID

1A 8" CLDIP Water Main 2,130 LF
1B 8" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 1,070 LF
2 8" Wet Tap and Valve 1 UNIT
3 8" Insertion Valve 1 UNIT
4 8" Gate Valve and Box 7 UNIT
5 8" x 8" CLDIP Tee 2 UNIT
6 4" x 8" CLDIP Reducer 1 UNIT
7 4" Gate Valve and Box 1 UNIT
8 4" (11.25, 22.5, 45 Degree) CLDIP Bends 4 UNIT

9A 4" CLDIP Water Main 6 LF
9B 4" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 6 LF
10 4" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT

11A 8" CLDIP 11.25 Degree Bend 10 UNIT
11B 8" CLDIP 22.5 Degree Bend 8 UNIT
11C 8" CLDIP 45 Degree Bend 36 UNIT
12 1" Curb Stop and Box 49 UNIT
13 1" Corporation Stop 49 UNIT
14 1" Type "K" Copper Water Service 1,500 LF
15 Fire Hydrant, Complete 5 UNIT
16 Trench Repair, Type I 50 LF
17 Trench Repair, Type II 3,245 LF
18 Trench Repair, Type IV 15 LF
19 Concrete Driveway Trench (If and Where Directed) 50 SY
20 Concrete Driveway Apron (If and Where Directed) 55 SY
21 Concrete Sidewalk (If and Where Directed) 40 SY
22 Concrete Curb (If and Where Directed) 30 LF
23 Monument Boxes (If and Where Directed) 5 UNIT
24 Test Pits (If and Where Directed) 5 UNIT
25 Paving Repair (If and Where Directed) 100 SY

26 Connection to Meter in Home (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT

27 8" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT

Mathematically Corrected Value

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

SUMMARY OF BIDS
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

Bid Opening  04/27/22 @ 11:00 AM

 EVERGREEN AND WHITE PINE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
MEDFORD TOWNSHIP

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25114 20

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
F: (973)-482-7154

NO BIDNO BID NO BID

F: NO FAX NUMBER F: (856)-863-2281
P: (856)-863-2280 P: (973)-482-1123P: (856)-629-2408

Newark, NJ 07104Williamstown, NJ 08094 Sewell, NJ 08080
14 Ogden Street849 Clayton Road 5 International Avenue

 & Rental, Inc. Contractors E&G Corp.
Neri's Construction  Pioneer Pipe Roman 



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

SUMMARY OF BIDS
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

Bid Opening  04/27/22 @ 11:00 AM

ALTERNATE #1
A1A 8" CLDIP Water Main 600 LF
A1B 8" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 200 LF
A2A 8" CLDIP 11.25 Degree Bend 2 UNIT
A2B 8" CLDIP 22.5 Degree Bend 1 UNIT
A2C 8" CLDIP 45 Degree Bend 10 UNIT
A4 Sampling Station 1 UNIT
A5 Trench Repair, Type I 560 LF
A6 Trench Repair, Type II 240 LF

TOTAL ALTERNATE #1 

TOTAL BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1

ALTERNATE #2
B1 6" CLDIP Water Main, Restrained Joint 500 LF
B2 6" Wet Tap and Valve 1 UNIT
B3 6" Gate Valve and Box 1 UNIT
B4 6" (11.25, 22.5, 45 Degree) CLDIP Bends 11 UNIT
B5 6" Sleeve Coupling 1 UNIT
B6 1" Curb Stop and Box 8 UNIT
B7 1" Corporation Stop 8 UNIT
B8 1" Type "K" Copper Water Service 160 LF
B9 2" Blow Off Hydrant 1 UNIT

B10 Trench Repair, Type II 500 LF
B11 Test Pits (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT
B12 Connection to Meter (If and Where Directed) 2 UNIT

TOTAL ALTERNATE #2

Mathematically Corrected Value

BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1 & #2 TOTAL 

 EVERGREEN AND WHITE PINE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
MEDFORD TOWNSHIP

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25114 20

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
F: (973)-482-7154F: NO FAX NUMBER F: (856)-863-2281

P: (856)-863-2280 P: (973)-482-1123P: (856)-629-2408

Newark, NJ 07104Williamstown, NJ 08094 Sewell, NJ 08080
14 Ogden Street849 Clayton Road 5 International Avenue

 & Rental, Inc. Contractors E&G Corp.
Neri's Construction  Pioneer Pipe Roman 

-- -- --

NO BID

--

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

----

NO BID NO BID


