

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC. SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 06/09/2022 @ 10:00 AM				2022 SANITARY SEWER REHAB PROJECT MOUNT LAUREL MUA BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 21911-00							
				Vortex Services, LLC		Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe		Insituform Technologies, LLC		En-Tech Corp.	
				210 Bennet Road Freehold, NJ 07728 P: (732)-625-9300 F: (732)-625-9300		1566 Harding Highway Newfield, NJ 08344 P: (856)-697-1900 F: (856)-697-0757		3014 US Highway 301 North, Suite 700 Tampa, FL 33619 P: (410)-271-5079 F: NO FAX GIVEN		91 Ruckman Road Closter, NJ 07624 P: (201)-784-1034 F: (201)-784-0855	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UN.	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID											
1	8" SEWER MAIN LINE PIPE	667	LF	\$54.00	\$36,018.00	\$60.00	\$40,020.00	\$82.00	\$54,694.00		
2	10" SEWER MAIN LINE PIPE	523	LF	\$68.00	\$35,564.00	\$74.00	\$38,702.00	\$73.00	\$38,179.00		
3	REFURBISHED MANHOLE	50	VF	\$694.00	\$34,700.00	\$650.00	\$32,500.00	\$459.00	\$22,950.00		
4	REMOVE AND REPLACE MANHOLE STEP (IF AND WHERE DIRECTED)	10	UN	\$450.00	\$4,500.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	\$213.00	\$2,130.00		
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE				\$110,782.00		\$113,222.00		\$117,953.00		NO BID	

				Sewer & Water Evaluation & Rehab Procedures-SWERP		Standard Pipe Services, LLC		Metra Industries, Inc.			
				1237 Hayes Boulevard Bristol, PA 19007 P: (215)-785-2242 F: (215)-785-2277		567 Walther Road Newark, DE 19702 P: (302)-286-0701 x 119 F: (302)-286-0704		50 Muller Place Little Falls, NJ 07424 P: (973)-812-0333 F: (973)-812-6596			
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UN.	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT		
BASE BID											
1	8" SEWER MAIN LINE PIPE	667	LF								
2	10" SEWER MAIN LINE PIPE	523	LF								
3	REFURBISHED MANHOLE	50	VF								
4	REMOVE AND REPLACE MANHOLE STEP (IF AND WHERE DIRECTED)	10	UN								
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID			